
                   
                                                                  Location and Access 
Barefoot Kuata resort is located on Kuata Island, the most 
southerly island in the Yasawas and closest to Nadi & 
Denarau. The resort is serviced daily by South Sea 
Cruises/Awesome Adventures Fiji’s ferry service departing 
from Port Denarau with connections from other Yasawa 
properties. Private transfer options include seaplane and 
helicopter. 

        Climate 
Tropical climate with average daily temperatures around 
32°C (92°F) in Spring/Summer (Sep-Feb) and average daily 
temperatures around 27°C (82°F) in Autumn/Winter (Mar-
Aug). Due to its westerly location The Yasawas has the 
lowest rainfall in Fiji.  

         Accommodation 4 Styles 
Beachfront Bure 4 units another 10 under construction. 
Stunning waterfront location with private beach access. 
Bures (Fijian for room) are spacious. Bedrooms are fan 
cooled with queen beds measuring 15.6m2 with total bures 
35.6m2 including shower under the star’s bathroom and 
private shaded decking area. Maximum capacity 2 adults 3 
children. 

 

 

Beachfront Bure floorplan  
 

Garden Bure 3 units. Still close to the beachfront with sea 
views from doorway. Bures (Fijian for room) as are 
spacious. Bedrooms are fan cooled with queen bed 
measuring 30m2.  Maximum capacity 2 adults 3 children. 
 

 

Safari Double Bure 4 units. Basic, fan cooled, very large 
room measuring an impressive 24m2 plus a private deck 
area.  

 

Double bed with nearby share bathroom facilities featuring 
hot showers. 

 

 



 

Dorm 6 beds per room, fan cooled, very large measuring an 
impressive 24m2 plus a private deck area. Nearby share 
bathroom facilities featuring hot showers.  

                                                                                Dining and Bar 

 

Dining operates under a mandatory a daily ‘Resort Package’ 
fee of FJ$119 per day per for adults and FJ$60 per day for 
children. This includes breakfast, lunch & dinner, Wi-Fi 
access and use of non-motorised water sports (excludes 
diving). Breakfast and lunch are buffets with an a la carter 
dinner.  

 

The restaurant bar area is handcrafted inspired by 
indigenous Fijian design and architecture. Impressive views 
look over the pool area out to the sea, with the Fijian 
islands of Wayalailai and Waya in the background.  

 

 

                                                               Activities & Experiences 

There are marked walking tracks around Kuata Island, some 
offering spectular stunning views of the Yasawa islands and 
the surrounding waters. Snorkelling equipment, kayaks, 
stand up paddles boards and scheduled daily activities e.g. 
Fijian Medicine Walk are offered for all houseguests. 
Barefoot Kuata offers exceptional marine activities and is 
renown for its snorkelling with sharks experience. 

 

The resort has a dive shop offering popular introductory 
dives, certified dives and SSI open water dive courses. A 
highlight for introductory divers and certified divers is the 
‘Awakening Shark Dive’. This new age shark dive with a 
focus on diver safety and conservation offers an 
exhilarating dive experience.  It’s the only open water big 
shark dive experience where non-certified divers can 
participate. 

 

 

 

www.barefootkuatafiji.com 
Ph +679 892 5125 
Reservations kuatares@bfcfiji.com   
Trade Info dosm@bfcfiji.com 
 


